H

N

I
N RPOOWONOU AW

[EEN
w

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

(Published in the Topeka Metro News April 21, 2014)
ORDINANCE NO. 19899
AN ORDINANCE introduced by City Manager Jim Colson, concerning the adoption of
the 2012 International Property Maintenance Code, repealing in
their entireties 8§ 6.35.060, § 8.60.180 through 8 8.60.220, and
Chapters 8.65, 8.70 and 8.75 of the Topeka Municipal Code, as
well as amending 8§ 2.25.250, § 8.60.010 through 8§ 8.60.170, §
8.80.040, §8.80.050, § 14.35.050 and § 14.70.150 and specifically
repealing said original sections.
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF TOPEKA, KANSAS:
Section 1. That section 2.25.250, Enforcing officer designated, Title, of The
Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Enforcing officer designated.

Structures—and-Abandoned-Property-Act—as—amended—tThe city manager—efthe—city
hereby designates the director-of-development-services-divisionpolice chief or designee
as the enforcing officer and-charges-the-director-of-development-services—division-with

Act-as-the-same-pertains-to-abandoned-property-onlyfor purposes of administering the

Unsafe or Dangerous Structures law, K.S.A. 12-1750 et seq.

Section 2.  That section 8.60.010, Title, of The Code of the City of Topeka,

Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Fitlelnternational Property Maintenance Code — Adopted.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 1



27

28

29

30

31

32

33

34

35

36

37

38

39

40

41

42

43

44

45

46

a7

48

49

The International Property Maintenance Code and Commentary, including all

appendices, 2012 Edition, as published by the International Code Council and amended

by this chapter (IPMC), is hereby adopted as the property maintenance code of the City

of Topeka to address the public health, safety, and welfare relative to the use and

maintenance of existing structures and premises.

Section 3.  That section 8.60.020, Scope, of The Code of the City of Topeka,

Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Seepelnternational Property Maintenance Code — On file in clerk’s office.

At least one copy of the International Property Maintenance Code, as amended,

shall be on file with the city clerk to be available for inspection by the public during

business hours.

Section 4. That section 8.60.030, Findings, purpose and intent, of The Code of

the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Firdings,purpose-andintentCode official designated.
2) This_divisi hall | I . L _which-i

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 2



50

51

52

53

54

55

56

57

58

59

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

67

68

69

70

71

72

Whenever the term “code official” is used in the IPMC, it shall be construed to

mean the chief of police or designee.

Section 5. That section 8.60.040, Severability, of The Code of the City of

Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 3



73

74

75

76

77

78

79

80

81

82

83

84

85

86

87

88

89

90

91

92

93

94

95

SeverabilityAmendments — Generally.

remaining—portions—of—this—division-The amendments to the International Property

Maintenance Code adopted herein shall be set out in this chapter. All references to

section and chapter numbers shall be construed as if followed by the words “of the

International Property Maintenance Code,” unless clearly indicated otherwise.

Section 6. That section 8.60.050, Definitions, of The Code of the City of
Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

PefinitionsSection 102 Applicability.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 4



96

97

98

99

100

101

102

103

104

105

106

107

108

109

110

111

112

113

114

115

116

117

118

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014



119

120

121

122

123

124

125

126

127

128

129

130

131

132

133

134

135

136

137

138

139

140

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014



141

142

143

144

145

146

147

148

149

150

151

152

153

154

155

156

157

158

159

160

161

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 7



162

163

164

165

166

167

168

169

170

171

172

173

174

175

176

177

178

179

180

181

182

183

184

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014



185

186

187

188

189

190

191

192

193

194

195

196

197

198

199

200

201

202

203

204

205

206

207

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014



208

209

210

211

212

213

214

215

216

217

218

219

220

221

222

223

224

225

226

227

228

229

230

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014

10



231

232

233

234

235

236

237

238

239

240

241

242

243

244

245

246

247

248

249

250

251

252

253

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014

11



254

255

256

257

258

259

260

261

262

263

264

265

266

267

268

269

270

271

272

273

274

275

Section 102.3 is deleted in its entirety and the following provisions are substituted

therefore:

Repairs, additions or alterations to a structure, or changes of occupancy, shall be

done in accordance with the building code in Chapter 14.20 TMC, the

international energy conservation code in Chapter 14.80 TMC, the international

fire code in Chapter 14.40 TMC, the mechanical code in Chapter 14.50 TMC, the

international residential code in Chapter 14.55 TMC, and the plumbing code in

Chapter 14.35 TMC.

Section 7.  That section 8.60.060, Authority to enforce, of The Code of the City
of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Authority to—enforeceSection 103 Department of Property Maintenance

Inspection.

Sections 103 is deleted in its entirety.

Section 8. That section 8.60.070, Authorization to enter premises, of The

Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Autheorizationto-enterpremisesSection 106 Violations; Abatements; Fees.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 12



276

277

278

279

280

281

282

283

284

285

286

287

288

289

290

201

292

293

294

295

296

297

298

Section 106.3, Prosecution of violation, is deleted in its entirety and the following

provision shall be substituted therefore:

A person who fails to comply with a notice of violation served in accordance with

Section 107, shall be quilty of a misdemeanor and, if convicted, may be punished

in accordance with TMC 1.10.070. A violation of this chapter shall be deemed a

strict liability offense. Abatement of a violation by the code official shall not be a

defense or excuse to a violation. The pendency of an administrative hearing

pursuant to section 8.60.110 shall not be a defense to a violation or prevent

prosecution and adjudication in municipal court.

Section 106.4, Violation penalties, is deleted in its entirety and the following

provisions shall be substituted therefore:

Administrative penalties.

(@) There shall be an administrative monetary penalty of $100.00

imposed on the owner or, in the case of inoperative vehicles, the vehicle owner

for each violation of this chapter that remains uncorrected after the time period

stated in the notice of violation has elapsed.

(b) The administrative monetary penalty for a second or subsequent

violation for which an administrative penalty has been imposed under this

chapter that remains uncorrected after the time period stated in the notice of

violation has elapsed for the same property within 12 months of the same or

substantially same violation shall be $200.00.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 13



299

300

301

302

303

304

305

306

307

308

309

310

311

312

313

314

315

316

317

318

319

320

Section 106.5. Abatement of violations, is deleted in its entirety and the following

provisions shall be substituted therefore:

(a) Abatement. Upon the expiration of the compliance period stated in

the notice of violation, the code official shall inspect the property. The code

official may grant an extension of time if the owner demonstrates that due

diligence is being exercised in abating the violation. If the owner has failed to

comply within the compliance period, has failed to timely request an appeal

hearing or, in the case of an unsafe structure, failed to appear at a hearing, the

code official may abate the violation and assess the costs against the owner. If

the costs are not paid within 30 days, the cost can be collected pursuant to

K.S.A. 12-1,115 and amendments thereto and/or charged against the property

pursuant to K.S.A. 12-1617e, K.S.A. 12-1617f, K.S.A. 12-1755, or K.S.A. 17-

4759 and amendments thereto.

(b) Fees. The costs incurred by the city for abatement, including any

administrative costs, shall be paid by the owner or, in the case of inoperative

vehicles, the vehicle owner. The administrative costs shall be:

General violations of the IPMC  $140.00

Weeds and grasses $140.00

Inoperative vehicles $175.00

Section 9.  That section 8.60.080, Emergency measures — Notices of less than
five days, of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as

follows:

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 14



321

322

323

324

325

326

327

328

329

330

331

332

333

334

335

336

337

338

339

340

341

342

Emergency-—measures—Neoticesof-less-than-five-daysSection 107 Notices

and Orders.

Section 107.2, Form, is deleted in its entirety and the following provisions shall

be substituted therefore:

The notice prescribed in Section 107.1 shall include the following:

1. Description of the real estate sufficient for identification.

2. A statement that includes a description of the conditions and

identifies violations of Chapter 8.60.

3. A statement of the correction action necessary and a reasonable

time to complete the action. A reasonable time shall not exceed 60 calendar

days.

4. A statement that if the violation(s) is not corrected within the

compliance period, the city may impose administrative penalties, abate the

violation, and assess the costs against the owner.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 15



343

344

345

346

347

348

349

350

351

352

353

354

355

356

357

358

359

360

361

362

363

364

365

5. A statement advising that any owner _may request an appeal

hearing before an administrative hearing officer. The request shall be submitted

to the code official within 10 calendar days from the date of service. Failure to

timely request a hearing will allow the city to impose administrative penalties,

abate the violation, and assess the costs against the owner. The scope of the

appeal shall be limited to the following: (i) whether the provisions of Chapter 8.60

apply: (ii) whether the code official has correctly interpreted Chapter 8.60; and/or

(iii) whether the requirements of Chapter 8.60 can be adequately satisfied by

other means.

6. A statement advising that failure to timely comply with the notice

may result in prosecution in municipal court regardless whether an administrative

hearing is pending.

7. If code official has determined that the structure is unsafe pursuant

to Section 108, the notice shall state that a hearing will be held before the

administrative hearing officer not less than 10 calendar days nor more than 30

calendar days after service of the notice.

Section 107.3, Method of Service, is deleted in its entirety and the following

provisions shall be substituted therefore:

(a) Method of Service. Notice shall be served in _one of the following

manners:
1. Personal service.
2. Certified mail, return receipt requested. Service shall be effective

on the date of receipt.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 16



366

367

368

369

370

371

372

373

374

375

376

377

378

379

380

381

382

383

384

385

386

387

3. If the property is unoccupied and the owner is _a nhonresident,

certified mail, return receipt requested, to the last known address.

4. If the location of a person is unknown or if no address is available

after diligent effort, then a copy of the notice shall be posted in a

conspicuous place on the premises and published once in the official city

newspaper. The failure of any such person to receive notice shall not

affect the validity of any proceedings.

5. If the code official has determined that a structure is unsafe

pursuant to Section 108 and the whereabouts of the owner are unknown

and cannot be ascertained in the exercise of reasonable diligence, the

code official may effect service by publishing the notice once each week

for two consecutive weeks in the official city newspaper. A copy of the

notice shall also be posted in a conspicuous place on the premises and a

copy of the notice shall be filed with the reqgister of deeds and the clerk of

the district court of Shawnee County.

6. In_addition to the methods identified in this section, the code official

may provide notice by other methods, including, but not limited to, door

hangers, conspicuously posting notice on the property, personal

notification, telephone or email communication, or first class mail.

7. As authorized by K.S.A. 12-1617f, the code official may provide a

one-time yearly written notice by mail or personal service to the owner or

occupant which will permit subsequent abatement mowings without any

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 17



388 additional notice. The notice shall also include a statement that no further

389 notice shall be given prior to cutting or removing weeds.

390 (b)  Service of Notice The notice shall be served upon the owner of record,
391 and one copy shall be served on each of the following, if known or available from
392 public records: (1) the holder of any mortgage, deed of trust, lien, or
393 encumbrance; and (2) the holder of any other estate or legal interest of record.
394 The failure of the code official to serve any person shall not invalidate any
395 proceedings hereunder as to any other person duly served or relieve such
396 person from any duty or obligation. If the code official has determined that a
397 structure is unsafe pursuant to Section 108, the notice shall also be served on
398 any occupant who can be ascertained.

399 (©) Proof of Service. Proof of service of the notice shall be certified at the time
400 of service by a written declaration under penalty of perjury executed by the
401 person effecting service, declaring the time, date and manner in which service
402 was made. The declaration, together with any receipt card returned in
403 acknowledgment of receipt by certified mail, shall be affixed to the copy of the
404 notice retained by the code official.

405 Section 10. That section 8.60.090, Conference to discuss complaint, of The
406 Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

407 Conference-to-discusscomplainrtSection 109 Emergency measures.

408

409

410

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 18



411

412

413

414

415

416

417

418

419

420

421

422

423

424

425

426

427

428

429

430

431

432

Section 109.5, Costs of emergency repair, is deleted in its entirety.

Section 109.6, Hearing, is deleted in its entirety.

Section 11. That section 8.60.100, Nuisance violation, contents, manner of
service, of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Nuisanceviolation—contents—mannerofserviceSection 110 Demolition.

Section 110.1, General, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following

provision shall be substituted therefore:

The code official shall order the owner of any premises upon which is located any

structure, which in the code official's judgment after review is so deteriorated or

dilapidated or has become so out of repair as to be dangerous, unsafe, insanitary or

otherwise unfit for human habitation or occupancy, and such that it is unreasonable to

repair the structure, to demolish and remove such structure; or if such structure is

capable of being made safe by repairs, to repair and make safe and sanitary, or to

board up and hold for future repair or to demolish and remove at the owner 's option; or

where there has been a cessation of normal construction of any structure for a period of

more than two years, the code official shall order the owner to demolish and remove

such structure, or board up until future repair. Boarding the building up for future repair

shall not extend beyond one year, unless approved by the code official.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 19



433

434

435

436

437

438

439

440

441

442

443

444

445

446

447

448

449

450

451

452

453

454

In this section, “unreasonable to repair’ means that the repair costs exceed 30%

of the replacement value of the structure as established by the Shawnee County

Appraiser.

Section 12. That section 8.60.110, Nuisance violation, weeds/grasses,

contents, manner of service, of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby

amended to read as follows:

Nuisance violation, weeds/grasses, contents, manner of serviceSection 111

Hearing .

Sections 111.1 through 111.8 are deleted in their entireties and the following provisions

shall be substituted therefore:

Section 111.1 Administrative Appeal Hearing

(@) An owner shall have the right to appeal the notice of violation to an

administrative hearing officer provided that a written application is submitted to

the code official within 10 calendar days from the date of service.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 20



455

456

457

458

459

460

461

462

463

464

465

466

467

468

469

470

471

472

473

474

475

476

ar7

(b)  An application for an appeal hearing shall be based on a claim that

(i) the provisions of Chapter 8.60 do not apply; (ii) the code official has incorrectly

interpreted Chapter 8.60; and/or (iii) the requirements of Chapter 8.60 can be

adequately satisfied by other means. The owner may not appeal a requirement

imposed by Chapter 8.60. Then intent of the appeal process is not to waive or

set aside a requirement; it is to provide a means of reviewing a code official's

decision on an interpretation or application of Chapter 8.60 or reviewing a code

official’s decision to approve or reject the equivalency of protection to a Chapter

8.60 requirement.

(©) The administrative hearing officer shall schedule a hearing within

three working days of receipt of the hearing request. Written notice of the hearing

date and time shall be provided to the person requesting the hearing by first

class mail. The hearing officer may continue the hearing to a later time.

(d) The administrative hearing officer shall review the notice of violation

and all relevant information. If the hearing officer determines that: (i) the

provisions of Chapter 8.60 apply; (ii) the code official has correctly interpreted

Chapter 8.60: and/or (iii) the requirements of Chapter 8.60 cannot be adequately

satisfied by other means, the hearing officer shall order abatement of the

violation, impose an administrative penalty, and assess the abatement costs

against the owner.

Section 111.2 Administrative Hearing; Unsafe Structure.

(a) After notice and hearing, if the administrative hearing officer

determines that a structure is unsafe pursuant to Section 108, the administrative

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 21



478

479

480

481

482

483

484

485

486

487

488

489

490

491

492

493

494

495

496

497

498

499

hearing officer shall state in writing the findings of facts in support of such

determination and shall issue and cause to be served upon the owner an order:

(1) to demolish and remove the structure within a prescribed period; or (2) if the

structure is capable of being made safe by repairs, to repair and make safe and

sanitary within a prescribed period.

(b) The administrative hearing officer may grant an extension of time

where the administrative hearing officer finds that there is practical difficulty or

undue hardship and that such extension is in harmony with the general purpose

of this chapter to secure compliance with the IPMC.

Section 13. That section 8.60.120, Nuisance violations, inoperative vehicles,

contents, and manner of service, of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby

amended to read as follows:

serviceSection 112 Stop Work Order.

Section 112.4, Failure to comply, is deleted is its entirety and the following

provision shall be substituted therefore:

It is unlawful to continue any work after being served with a stop work order,

unless the work is to remove a violation or abate an unsafe condition. The

person may be punished in accordance with TMC 1.10.070.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 22



500 Section 14. That section 8.60.130, Property maintenance violations, contents
501 and manner of service, of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended
502 to read as follows:

503 Property maintenance violations, contents and manner of serviceSection

504 202 General Definitions.

505

506

507

508

509

510

511

512

513

514

515

516

517

518

519

520

521

522

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 23



523

524

525

526

527

528

529

530

531

532

533

534

535

536

537

538

539

540

541

542

543

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014

24



544

545

546

o547

548

549

550

551

552

553

554

555

556

557

558

559

560

561

562

563

564

565

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014

25



566

567

568

569

570

571

572

573

574

575

576

S77

578

579

580

581

582

583

584

585

586

587

588

The definition of “Rubbish” as set forth in Section 202 is deleted is its entirety and

the following provision shall be substituted therefore:

Combustible and noncombustible waste materials, except garbage. The term

shall include but not be limited to: trash, junk, metal objects, plumbing fixtures,

appliances, auto parts, tires, fencing, lumber, discarded or broken furniture,

clothing, paper, rags, cartons, boxes, wood, excelsior, rubber, leather, tree

branches, vard trimmings, tin cans, glass, crockery or the accumulation of any

other similar materials.

Section 15. That section 8.60.140, Notices applicable to future owners, of The

Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Netices-apphcable-to-future-ownersSection 302 Exterior Property Areas.

Section 302.4, Weeds, is deleted is its entirety and the following provision shall

be substituted therefore:

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 26



589 Weeds. All premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from weeds

590 or plant growth in excess of twelve inches in height. All noxious weeds shall be
591 prohibited. Weeds shall be defined as all grasses, annual plants and vegetation,
592 other than trees or shrubs provided; however this term shall not include cultivated
593 flowers and gardens. Upon failure of the owner or agent having charge of the
594 property to comply with this section after service of a notice of violation, the
595 person may be subject to prosecution in accordance with Section 106.3. Upon
596 failure to comply with the notice, the city or its contractor may enter upon the
597 property to remove or destroy the weeds and/or vegetation and assess the costs
598 against the owner.

599 Section 16. That section 8.60.150, Placarding and order to vacate, of The Code
600 of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

601 Placardingand-erderto-vacateSection 304 Exterior Structure.

602

603

604

605

606

607

608

609

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 27



610

611

612

613

614

615

616

617

618

619

620

621

622

623

624

625

626

627

628

629 Section 304.14, Insect screens, is deleted is its entirety and the following

630 provision shall be substituted therefore:

631 Every door, window and other outside opening required for ventilation of

632 habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food service areas or any areas where

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 28



633 products to be included or utilized in food for human consumption are processed,

634 manufactured, packaged or stored shall be supplied with approved tightly fitting

635 screens of minimum 16 mesh per inch (16 mesh per 25 mm).

636 Section 17. That section 8.60.160, Designation of hearing officer — Procedures,
637 penalty for failure to comply with administrative order, of The Code of the City of
638 Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

639

640

641

642

643

644

645

646

647

648

649

650

651

652

653

654

655

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 29



656

657

658

659

660

661

662

663

664

665

666

667

668

669

670

671

672 Section 308.2, Disposal of rubbish, is deleted is its entirety and the following

673 provision shall be substituted therefore:

674 Every occupant of a structure shall dispose of rubbish in accordance with TMC

675 8.25.010.

676 Section 308.2.1, Rubbish storage facilities is deleted is its entirety.

677 Section 308.3, Disposal of garbage, is deleted in its entirety and the following

678 provision shall be substituted therefore:

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 30



679

680

681

682

683

684

685

686

687

688

689

690

691

692

693

694

695

696

697

698

699

700

701

Every occupant of a structure shall dispose of garbage in accordance with TMC

8.25.010.

Section 308.3.1, Garbage facilities, is deleted is its entirety.

Section 308.3.2, Containers, is deleted is its entirety.

Section 18. That section 8.60.170, Criteria for granting variances, of The Code

of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Criteria-for-granting-varianeesSection 309 Pest Elimination.

Section 309.3, Single occupant, is deleted is its entirety and the following

provision shall be substituted therefore:

The occupant of a one-family dwelling or of a single-tenant nonresidential

structure shall be responsible for extermination on the premises after 30 days of

occupancy.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 31



702 Section 309.4, Multiple occupancy, is deleted is its entirety and the following

703 provision shall be substituted therefore:

704 The owner of a structure containing two or more dwelling units, a multiple

705 occupancy, a rooming house or a nonresidential structure shall be responsible

706 for extermination in the public or shared areas of the structure and exterior

707 property.

708 Section 19. That section 8.60.180, Administrative penalties, of The Code of the

709 City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

710 AdministrativepenattiesSection 602 Heating Facilities.
711

712

713

714

715

716

717

718

719

720

721

722

723

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 32



724

725

726

727

728

729

730

731

732 Section 602.2, Residential occupancies, is deleted is its entirety and the following
733 provision shall be substituted therefore:

734 Dwellings shall be provided with heating facilities capable of maintaining a room
735 temperature of 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms.
736 Cooking appliances shall not be used, nor shall portable unvented fuel-burning
737 space heaters be used, as a means to provide required heating.

738 Section 602.3, Heat supply, is deleted is its entirety and the following provision
739 shall be substituted therefore:

740 Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or lets one or more
741 dwelling units or sleeping units on terms, either express or implied, to furnish
742 heat to the occupants shall supply heat to maintain a temperature of not less
743 than 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms.

744 Exceptions:

745 1. When the outdoor temperature is below the winter outdoor design
746 temperature for the locality, maintenance of the minimum room temperature shall

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 33



147

748

749

750

751

752

753

754

755

756

757

758

759

760

761

762

763

764

765

766

767

768

not be required provided that the heating system is operating at its full design

capacity. The winter outdoor design temperature for the locality shall be as

indicated in Appendix D of the International Plumbing Code.

Section 602.4, Occupiable work spaces, is deleted is its entirety and the following

provision shall be substituted therefore:

Indoor occupiable work spaces shall be supplied with heat to maintain a

temperature of not less than 65°F (18°C) during the period the spaces are

occupied.

Exceptions:

1. Processing, storage and operation areas that require cooling or

special temperature conditions.

2. Areas in which persons are primarily engaged in vigorous physical

activities.

Section 20. That section 8.60.190, Abatements, of The Code of the City of

Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

AbatementsSection 605 Electrical Equipment.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 34



769

770

771

772

773

774

775

776

i

778

779

780

781

782

783

784

785

786

787

Section 605.2, Receptacles, is deleted in its entirety and the following provision

shall be substituted therefore:

Every habitable space in a dwelling shall contain at least two separate and

remote receptacle outlets. Every laundry area shall contain at least one

grounded-type receptacle or a receptacle with a ground fault circuit interrupter.

Every bathroom shall contain at least one receptacle. All kitchen countertop

receptacles and all bathroom receptacles are required to be a receptacle with a

ground fault circuit interrupter. All receptacle outlets shall have the appropriate

faceplate cover for that location.

Section 21. That section 8.60.200, Abatement costs, of The Code of the City of

Topeka, Kansas, is hereby repealed.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 35



788

789

790

791

792

793

794

795

796

797

798

799

800

801

802

803

804

805

806

807

808

Section 22. That section 8.60.210, Assessment of costs, of The Code of the

City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby repealed.

Section 23. That section 8.60.220, Criminal penalties, of The Code of the City

of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby repealed.

Section 24. That section 6.35.060, Livestock as a nuisance, of The Code of the

City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby repealed.

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 36



809

810

811

812

813

814

815

816

817

818

819

820

821

822

823

824

825

826

827

828

829

830

831

Section 25. That section 8.80.040, Procedure upon receipt of moneys —
Investigation, of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Procedure upon receipt of moneys — Investigation.

€)) Upon receipt of moneys as provided for by this chapter, the city treasurer

shall immediately notify the director—of-development-services—divisionpolice chief or

designee of such receipt, and transmit all documentation received from the insurance

company to the director-of-developmentservices-divisionpolice chief or designee.

(b)  Within 20 days of the receipt of the moneys as provided by this chapter,

the director-of-development-services—divisionpolice chief or designee shall determine,

based upon investigation, whether the city shall instigate proceedings under the

provisions of K.S.A. 12-1750 through 12-1756, as amended, and Chapter 8-758.60
TMC. For purposes of this chapter, director-of-development-services-divisionpolice chief
or _designee shall be the enforcement official with responsibility for determining an
immediate hazard, pursuant to K.S.A. 12-1750 et seq., and the administrator of the
environmental code services program shall be the enforcement official with
responsibility for enforcement of Chapter 8-#58.60 TMC.

(©) Prior to the expiration of the 20-day period established in this section, the
enforcement official shall notify the city treasurer whether the city intends to initiate
proceedings under K.S.A. 12-1750 through 12-1756, as amended, and Chapter
8-758.60 TMC.

(d) If the enforcement official has determined that proceedings under K.S.A.

12-1750 through 12-1756, as amended, or Chapter 8-#58.60 TMC shall be initiated, he

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 37



832

833

834

835

836

837

838

839

840

841

842

843

844

845

846

847

848

849

850

851

852

853

854

or she will do so immediately, but no later than 30 days after receipt of the moneys by
the city treasurer.

(e) Upon natification to the city treasurer by the enforcement official that no
proceedings shall be initiated under K.S.A. 12-1750 through 12-1756, as amended, or
Chapter 8-#58.60 TMC, the city treasurer shall return all moneys received to the insured
or insureds as identified in the communication from the insurance company. Such return
shall be accomplished within 30 days of the receipt of the moneys from the insurance
company or companies.

Section 26. That section 8.80.050, Removal of structure — Excess moneys, of
The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Removal of structure — Excess moneys.

€) If the enforcement official has proceeded under the provisions of K.S.A.
12-1750 through 12-1756, as amended, or Chapter 8-+#58.60 TMC, all moneys in
excess of that which is ultimately necessary to comply with the provisions for the
removal of the building or structure, less salvage value, if any, shall be paid to the
insured.

(b) If the enforcement official, with regard to a building or other structure
damaged by fire, explosion, or windstorm determines that it is necessary to act under

K.S.A. 12-1756 or Chapter 8.60 TMC-8-#5-010-et-seg-, any proceeds received by the

city treasurer under the authority granted in this chapter relating to that building or other
structure shall be used to reimburse the city for any expenses incurred by the city in

proceeding under K.S.A. 12-1756 or Chapter 8.60 TMC—8-75.:010—et—seg. Upon

reimbursement from the insurance proceeds, the enforcement official shall immediately

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 38



855

856

857

858

859

860

861

862

863

864

865

866

867

868

869

870

871

872

873

874

875

876

877

effect the release of the lien resulting therefrom. Should the expenses incurred by the
city exceed the insurance proceeds paid over to the city treasurer under TMC 8.80.030,
the enforcement official shall publish a new lien in an amount equal to such excess
expenses incurred.

Section 27. That section 14.35.050, 101.11.5, Moved Buildings, of The Code of
the City of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.11.5, Moved Buildings.

101.11.5, Moved Buildings, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following
provisions shall be substituted therefor:

Plumbing systems that are part of buildings or structures moved into this

jurisdiction shall comply with the provisions of City-ef Fopeka-Ceoede,Fitle-8, Health-and
Sanitation—8-70-Standards—Article Hnterior-StructureChapter 8.60 TMC and Section

103.5.5.2 of the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code.

Section 28. That section 14.70.150, Application — Fee, of The Code of the City
of Topeka, Kansas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Application — Fee.

(a8 A person desiring a moving permit shall file an application with the
development coordination office on a form provided by such office. Along with the
application the applicant shall:

(1)  Submit a written document from any affected utility stating whether it will
be necessary to cut and move, raise or in any way interfere with any wires, cables or
other aerial equipment of any public or municipally owned utility, and if so, the

application shall state also the name of such public or municipally owned utility, and the

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 39



878

879

880

881

882

883

884

885

886

887

888

889

890

891

892

893

894

895

896

897

898

899

900

time and location that the applicant's moving operations shall necessitate the cutting,
moving, raising or otherwise interfering with such aerial facilities.

(2)  Submit a legal description of current and future locations of the structure.

(3)  Submit a proposed map to be used in the moving of the structure.

(4)  Submit the address of current and future locations of the structure.

(5)  Submit the name of the moving company if applicable.

(6)  Submit a fee for the moving permit in the amount of $75.00.

(7 Submit proof of public liability insurance with limits of liability of not less
than $25,000 for bodily injury to any one person and $50,000 for bodily injuries in any
one accident to property in any one accident.

(8) Submit a schedule for moving of the structure as provided by the police
department pursuant to TMC 14.70.030.

(b) If the structure is to be relocated within the city, the following additional
requirements shall apply:

(1) Pay a relocation fee of $125.00.

(2) Before the structure is removed, a footing and/or footing and foundation
for the structure must be in place.

3) Upon relocation of a one- or two-family dwelling, the structure must
comply with the housing code, Chapter 8-7068.60 TMC.

(Inspections for compliance with such standards may require on-site testing at
the applicant’s expense.)

(©) Upon submission of all required information, payment of the applicable fee

and approval by the city engineer and city forester, the development coordination office

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 40



901
902
903
904
905
906
907
908
909
910
911
912
913
914
915
916
917
918
919
920
921
922
923
924
925
926

927
928

shall issue the moving permit.

Section 29. That original 8 8.60.010 through 8§ 8.60.170, 8§ 8.80.040, §
8.80.050, § 14.35.050 and § 14.70.150 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, are
hereby specifically repealed.

Section 30. That Chapter 8.65 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is
hereby repealed.

Section 31. That Chapter 8.70 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is
hereby repealed.

Section 32. That Chapter 8.75 of The Code of the City of Topeka, Kansas, is
hereby repealed.

Section 33. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force on July 1, 2014, and
after its passage, approval and publication in the official City newspaper.

Section 34. This ordinance shall supersede all ordinances, resolutions or rules,
or portions thereof, which are in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance.

Section 35. Should any section, clause or phrase of this ordinance be declared
invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, the same shall not affect the validity of this
ordinance as a whole, or any part thereof, other than the part so declared to be invalid.

PASSED AND APPROVED by the Governing Body on April 15, 2014.

CITY OF TOPEKA, KANSAS

Larry E. Wolgast, Mayor
ATTEST:

Brenda Younger, City Clerk

ORD/IPMC 2012 4/16/2014 41



